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"The Myth of Senility — Misconcep­
tions About The Brain and Aging", by 
Robin Morantz Henig, Anchor Press-
Doubleday, Garden City, New York, 
1981; 317 pp., $17.95. 

The author of this new, easily 
readable little book is a Washington 
science writer whose publications have 
appeared in various American popular 
science magazines. Stirred on by the 
spry mentality of her 75-year-old 
grandfather and similar alert, active, 
old people, the author has expanded 
her initial article of concern about men­
tal incapacitation accompanying aging 
(in the New York Times Magazine) 
into this highly entertaining and 
reasonably accurate discussion of true 
senility and the myths which have ac­
companied aging of the nervous system 
for many decades. 
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the National Institute on Aging, Henig 
has concocted a very pleasant mix of 
scientific descriptions of the studies 
dealing with the aging human brain 
with personal anecdotes of patients and 
families grappling with Alzheimer's 
dementia, wherein senility is no longer 
a myth. She has a generally accurate 
grasp of recent work carried out by 
numerous prominent investigators 
laboring in the field — including 
Eisdorfer, Drachman, Roth, Kleemeier, 
Katzman, and even a few Canadians 
such as David Schonfield and Donald 
Crapper. Most of her scientific conden­
sations should be understandable by 
anyone with a layman's grasp of 
modern medicine, although it has been 
difficult for the author to place in 
proper perspective some of the claims 
for magic, therapeutic cures of loss of 
higher cognitive function in old age, 
which occasionally border on the ab­
surd. 
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The 10th, final chapter, "A Look To 
The Future", leaves the reader with 
some optimism that the American 
federal research establishment is at last 
beginning to acknowledge the impor­
tance of the gerontological "lobby"; 
and the book concludes with a series of 
well-documented Notes, offering ample 
bibliographic references for further 
reading. 

Although investigators researching 
the neurobiology of aging will un­
doubtedly find occasional, generally 
minor inaccuracies, this book repre­
sents an admirable effort to discuss the 
medical aspects of the aging human 
nervous system for the general public, 
and would make an excellent sugges­
tion for any clinical neuroscientists 
beset by the frustrated relatives of a 
demented patient. 
MJ. Ball, M.D., University Hospital, 

London, Ontario 
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