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MODERN DEVELOPMENTS IN CHOLINERGIC (MUS­
CARINIC) RECEPTORS AND DRUGS. Edited by P.A. van 
Zwieten and E. Schoenbaum. Published by VCH Publishers. 
122 pages. $64 Cdn. approx. 

MOVEMENT DISORDERS - A COMPREHENSIVE SUR­
VEY. 1989. By William J. Weiner and Anthony E. Lang. 
Published by Futura Publishing Company. 735 pages. $140 Cdn. 
approx. 

NEURAL MECHANISMS IN DISORDERS OF MOVEMENT. 
1989. SERIES: CURRENT PROBLEMS IN NEUROLOGY. 
VOLUME 9. Edited by A.R. Crossman and M.A. Sambrook. 
Published by John Libbey. 455 pages. $65 Cdn. approx. 

NEUROIMAGING II. 1989. Edited by F. Aichner, F. 
Gerstenbrand, N. Grcevic. Published by Gustav Fischer. 322 
pages. $108 Cdn. approx. 

NEUROLOGY OF PREGNANCY. 1989. SECOND EDITION. 
By James O. Donaldson. Published by W.B. Saunders. 347 
pages. $ 130 Cdn. approx. 

Canadian Association of Neuroscience Nurses 

Call for Abstracts 

The Canadian Association of Neuroscience Nurses is accepting 
abstracts for their 21st Annual Scientific Sessions to be held 
June 27-29, 1990 in Banff, Alberta. Applications must be post­
marked by December 1st, 1989. For abstract application forms 
and/or registration information contact Maureen Robertson, Box 
676, Bragg Creek, Alberta TOL 0K0. 

Call for Abstracts 

The 1990 Scientific Program Committee is pleased to announce 
the call for abstracts. We have chosen a theme in keeping with 
our superb conference location in Banff next year: 

P rofessionalism 
E thical-legal issues 
A chievement 
K nowledge 
S pecialization 

in Neuroscience Nursing 

There will be three formats from which to choose. Papers will 
be 20 minutes in length with 10 minutes for discussion. Still the 
mainstay of the program, they provide a good opportunity for 
reporting an interesting case study, the results of a new program, 
research, etc. Those of you who would like to generate more 
audience participation might consider a 40 minute work 
shop/discussion session. These longer sessions could provide 
opportunity for a panel discussion, a hands on review of anato­
my, or a practice session on assessment techniques. We will also 
have a special display area for posters. For the shy or creatively 
inclined, posters offer an excellent medium for displaying 

NEUROTRAUMA, TREATMENT, REHABILITATION AND 
RELATED ISSUES. 1989. Edited by Michael E. Miner and 
Karen A. Wagner. Published by Butterworths. 214 pages. $50 
Cdn. approx. 

OPPORTUNISTIC INFECTIONS IN PATIENTS WITH THE 
ACQUIRED IMMUNODEFICIENCY SYNDROME. SERIES: 
INFECTIOUS DISEASE AND THERAPY VOLUME 3. Edited 
by Gifford Leoung and John Mills. Published by Marcel 
Dekker, Inc. 445 pages. $100 Cdn. approx. 

PROBLEMS AND CONCEPTS IN DEVELOPMENTAL NEU­
ROPHYSIOLOGY. Edited by Peter Kellaway and Jeffrey L. 
Noebels. Published by John Hopkins University Press. 297 
pages. $56 Cdn. approx. 

RECENT ADVANCES IN CLINICAL DYSARTHRIA. 1989. 
Edited by Kathryn M. Yorkston and David R. Beukelman. 
Published by College-Hill Press/Little, Brown and Company. 
290 pages. $38 Cdn. approx. 

everything from your latest revision of neuro assessment and 
charting forms, to telling a picture story of a success in rehabili­
tation, or reporting research results. Whether you choose to do a 
paper, a workshop/discussion, or a poster, please complete the 
abstract submission form and mail it by December 1st to: 
Marlene Reimer, Chairperson, CANN Scientific Program, 
Faculty of Nursing, The University of Calgary, 2500 University 
Dr. N.W., Calgary, Alberta T2N 1N4 

The 1989 Heinz Lehmann Award 

The 1989 Heinz Lehmann Award was presented on July 24, 
1989, in Cambridge, England, to Dr. Alan A. Boulton, of 
Saskatoon. The award is given for excellence in research in the 
field of neuropsychopharmacology, which is the study of the 
effects of drugs on the brain. 

Dr. Boulton is director of the Neuropsychiatric Research Unit 
and Professor of Psychiatry at the University of Saskatchewan. 
He received the award, a commemorative plaque and a money 
gift, at the 12th annual meeting of the Canadian College of 
Neuropsychopharmacology. This year, the College met jointly 
with the British Association for Psychopharmacology July 23 to 
26. 

The award recognizes the originality of Dr. Boulton's research, 
which has led to significant new knowledge in his field. As a 
recipient, he is expected to make an oral presentation, preferably 
suitable for publication, at the 1990 annual meeting of the 
College. Hoffmann-La Roche Ltd. of Canada is the sponsor of 
the Heinz Lehmann Award. It is presented annually for work 
done primarily in Canada by Canadian scientists. 
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