
this was also my biggest question about Undesirable
Immigrants, which I think reveals the close association
between our two works, and the fundamental challenge of
writing a book that tries to point out the impacts of
longstanding structural forces without forsaking all hope
for the future.
Rosenberg’s first question is about the role of race in

perpetuating the migrant/refugee binary. In short, I view
the migrant/refugee binary as highly racialized, especially
as it relates to the responses of Global North receiving
states, but I think the persistence of the binary is about
much more than race. Recent public enthusiasm about
welcoming Ukrainians as refugees illustrates the point that
a lot of the resistance to border crossers from Africa or the
Muslim world into Europe and fromCentral America into
theUnited States is related to the race of the people seeking
entry. I talk in the book about how these figures are highly
racialized in the imaginations of American and European
publics, and how racialization can enhance public disre-
gard for their suffering and deservingness. When and if the
binary can be used to define racialized others as migrants, it
serves to enable states to keep out people deemed unde-
sirable without seeming overtly racist. This phenomenon
can be true even as Global North states do choose to
resettle some non-white people as refugees, since a strict
adherence to the binary promises to keep those numbers
manageably low.
However, in the Global South, the story is more

complex. Ambivalent public reactions may include some
element of racialization (see Lamis Abdelaaty, Discrimina-
tion and Delegation: Explaining State Responses to Refugees,
2021, who found more openness to people from the same
ethnic background as the dominant group in the receiving
state), but it takes a very different form than the white
supremacist racial politics of the Global North. For
instance, when Syrians enter Lebanon or Venezuelans
enter Colombia or Rohingya enter Bangladesh, receiving
state reluctance and the decision to frame arrivals as
migrants is about many things besides race, including
sending a message to IOs or wealthy donor states about
burden sharing.
Rosenberg’s remaining questions are about who I think

should change, and how likely I think change is. To be
clear: I do not think Global North politicians or even
UNHCR will move beyond binary thinking willingly,
because it benefits them directly. However, I do have
some optimism that the scholarly and advocacy commu-
nities can take a more critical look at the language we use
and who it is serving. Unsurprisingly, since Crossing was
published, I have found scholars of and advocates for
people who get classified as migrants to be far more
receptive to this point than people who self-identify as
refugee advocates. However, I have also seen a critical turn
against positivism even within the refugee studies com-
munity, especially as more work has engaged with the

colonial legacies of the Refugee Convention (Lucy May-
blin and Joe Turner, Migration Studies and Colonialism,
2021; Ulrike Krause, “Colonial Roots of the 1951 Refugee
Convention and Its Effects on the Global Refugee Regime,
Journal of International Relations and Development
24:599–626 [2021]).
Both Undesirable Immigrants and Crossing point to

seemingly intractable forces of resistance to any acknowl-
edgement of the deep injustice of colonial history and neo-
colonial practices of protecting privilege. All we can do as
scholars is to keep pointing out who benefits and who
suffers under the status quo.

Undesirable Immigrants: Why Racism Persists in
International Migration. By Andrew S. Rosenberg. Princeton, NJ:
Princeton University Press, 2022. 384p. $120.00 cloth, $35.00 paper.
doi:10.1017/S1537592723001111

— Rebecca Hamlin , University of Massachusetts, Amherst
rhamlin@umass.edu

Andrew Rosenberg’s Undesirable Immigrants is a cutting-
edge work of International Relations (IR) scholarship, and
it is deeply critical of the IR field. It is also a brave book
written with much integrity and care for the topic,
method, and intended audience. I am grateful to have
been asked to review it, since I found it not just convinc-
ing, but stimulating and refreshing. I hope it is widely read
and considered by IR scholars and anyone interested in
international migration.
Rosenberg begins with the basic puzzle of interna-

tional migration, that widespread political resistance to
immigration exists as an exception to liberal capitalism’s
commitment to global free movement of goods and ideas.
He then very carefully demonstrates another dimension
to this puzzle, the reality that even as immigration laws
have become facially race-neutral around the world, their
effects are still systematically uneven. In other words,
people who originate in the Global South or in post-
colonial states have far less freedom of mobility than
people who tend to be perceived in immigrant receiving
states as white.
Rosenberg then explains this disparity, which he calls an

“underflow” of legal migration from the non-white world,
using three related theories, which he grounds methodi-
cally using an impressive blend of historical analysis, post-
colonial theory, and sophisticated quantitative models.
First, he argues that the right to control borders has not
always been a core aspect of state sovereignty, but rather
was constructed alongside the modern nation-state. As the
source of authority shifted to “the people” rather than a
monarch, modern nation-states became concerned about
the composition of their peoples. Thus, the idea of keeping
out undesirable immigrants became a matter of nationalist
concern. Second, Rosenberg explains how colonialism
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created an uneven world in which colonial powers drasti-
cally redistributed global wealth to themselves while
simultaneously constructing colonial subjects as racially
“other”, inferior, more prone to violence, and less capable
of self-rule. These intertwined processes made the citizens
of postcolonial states into undesirable immigrants in the
minds of Global North publics, because of both their
poverty and their perceived racial inferiority. Finally, and
quite ambitiously, Rosenberg posits that constructed
notions of sovereignty have placed postcolonial indepen-
dent states under the “hegemony of the nation-state
model”, which expects them to perform sovereignty to
gain legitimacy in the eyes of the hegemonic powers
(p. 223). This dynamic leads Global South states to enact
harsh border control measures of their own.
Taken together, the three prongs of Rosenberg’s argu-

ment point very clearly to colonialism as the root of the
persistent racial bias we see in international migration
today. He concludes with the assertion that, without an
acknowledgement of colonial history, there is little chance
of understanding or resolving the damage colonialism has
caused. Undesirable Immigrants is deeply critical of the
field of IR for its general lack of attention to colonialism as
a historical force that shaped the ongoing dynamics of
international relations.
This book has so much to commend it, I can only

briefly highlight its strengths in the space allotted. First
and foremost is its centering of colonialism as a corrective
to so much work in IR and Migration Studies that has
overlooked that topic. I deeply appreciated how anti-
colonial, postcolonial, and Third World Approaches to
International Law scholarship informed the theoretical
development of the book. I also was impressed by the care
with which Rosenberg discussed the topics of race and
racism, going to great lengths to explain why race is a social
construction and racism is an ideology based on a belief in
white supremacy. Building on this care, I was particularly
thrilled by the diligence with which he developed thought-
ful measures of tricky concepts that matched the theory,
and did not reproduce or reify problematic racial categories
in the quantitative portions of the book. For example,
instead of using racial data to demonstrate the pattern of
racial bias in immigration policy, he developed a complex
“average ancestral distance” measure, to show that states
tend to have restrictive reactions to the arrival of people
whose time at which they share a common ancestor is
further away (p. 155). He also shows how former colonial
powers tend to particularly increase their restrictive poli-
cies when they get influxes of arrivals from the places they
colonized. In these ways, Rosenberg walks the walk of
someone who rejects race as anything other than a con-
struct, but still wants to use data to demonstrate racism as
an ideology functioning in the world.
At the same time, I wish the book had been organized to

integrate the theoretical and quantitative components a bit

more, because I think it would have flowed more logically
to have the quantitative analysis interspersed alongside the
theory it is testing. The book also sunk into some deep
“inside baseball” at points, wading through debates about
various schools of thought within IR that did not seem
central to the argument. I also was surprised to find that
after the opening vignette of the book, there were almost
no specific examples provided of migration restrictions
that look colorblind but have racially disparate impact.
I know that IR is very focused on the big picture and
large-scale trends, but more cases to sink one’s teeth into
would have grounded this reader and better supported the
argument.

While the book was very thoroughly researched, there
were a few topics I wish Rosenberg had engaged with
more. First is an exploration of law and legality in the
analysis, particularly because the existence of facially neu-
tral laws that have disparate impact is a central concern for
the field of law and society. Similarly, I understand that the
quantitative analysis could only cover legal immigration
because that is what the data can measure systematically,
but more exploration of the ways in which anxiety about
unauthorized migration informs immigration policymak-
ing would have enriched the discussion. Further, I am
curious whether Rosenberg views his argument as com-
patible with the growing literature expanding James Holli-
field’s concept of “the migration state” to include the
Global South and postcolonial world (James Hollifield,
“The Emerging Migration State,” International Migration
Review 38[3]: 885–912 [2004]; see also Fiona B. Adam-
son, and Gerasimos Tsourapas, “The Migration State in
the Global South: Nationalizing, Developmental, and
Neoliberal Models of Migration Management,” Interna-
tional Migration Review 54[3], 853–882 [2020]; see also
Kamal Sadiq, and Gerasimos Tsourapas, “The Postcolo-
nial Migration State,” European Journal of International
Relations 27[3], 884–912 [2021]). I would have also loved
to see an engagement with the work of legal scholar
E. Tendayi Achiume, who argues that contemporary
migration is a form of decolonization (refer to “Migration
as Decolonization,” Stanford Law Review 71 [2019]).
Finally, while the book talks a lot about the development
of the concept of sovereignty, and a lot about colonialism,
I think it could have spent more time discussing how the
concept of sovereignty was developed in service of the
colonial project (Hamlin 2021).

I found the section of the book that develops a model to
estimate the global migration “underflow” fascinating, but
I wondered why Rosenberg chose the language he used to
describe it. The baseline theoretical model includes “the
important variables that should drive the migration
between states” (p. 132). Rosenberg calls this baseline
model an ideal world without racial bias, but economic
inequality and war are still rampant. Rather than an ideal
world, it seems to be estimating what migration would
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look like in a world without so-called national interest
translated into law and policy. The comparison between
this model and estimated actual migration numbers reveals
that there is much less legal immigration than there would
be if push and pull factors acted unobstructed by law
(p. 133). So, I left this section wondering, is the baseline
model just estimating migration in an open borders world?
And if so, why did Rosenberg make the choice to not frame
it that way? I think a more explicit discussion of what the
model is imagining would have been really powerful.
Finally, I finished the book wondering how Rosenberg’s

clear findings of culpability could be translated into a sense
of obligation among the powerful. He argues that rich
countries tend to “ascribe economic insecurity as a deserved
status for those living in poor countries” (p. 202). This
point seems key, as it highlights the ways in which former
colonial powers continue to benefit from a total denial of
the negative impacts of colonialism. It is because of this
denial, and the depth with which the current state of affairs
benefits the powerful, that I am not optimistic that sover-
eignty can be reconceived, even by an “exogenous shock”
like climate change, as Rosenberg suggests (p. 283).We see
how miserably the world has failed to respond with “cos-
mopolitan empathy” for fellow humans in need during the
COVID-19 pandemic (p. 283). Thus, I am deeply skep-
tical that any form of migration “cooperation” between
states could be free from the dynamics of “uneven
sovereignties” (Hamlin 2021). As Rosenberg acknowl-
edges, the concepts of national interest and national secu-
rity have become convenient stand-ins for racism, and as I
have argued, even the concept of the “refugee,” a supposed
exception to the rule of sovereign border control, has been
used in this way. Given how convincingly he establishes the
entrenched roots of the current system, I would have liked
to hear more about whether Rosenberg truly is optimistic
about the potential for change.

Response to Rebecca Hamlin’s Review of
Undesirable Immigrants: Why Racism Persists in
International Migration
doi:10.1017/S1537592723001123

— Andrew S. Rosenberg

I thank Rebecca Hamlin for her generous and thorough
review of my book. I am heartened that the book’s main
purpose to, in Hamlin’s words, “point very clearly to
colonialism as the root of the persistent racial bias we see
in international migration today” shone through. I partic-
ularly enjoyed engaging with her insightful comments on
its shortcomings, addressing which would have made the
book stronger. My comments on her main points follow,
and I hope that this conversation will encourage scholars of

IR and migration to continue to center colonialism and
racism in their examinations of contemporary politics.
In her review, Hamlin suggests several topics, authors,

and literatures that she wished I had engaged with. They
include, among others, exploring law and legality, con-
necting my argument to the literature on the “migration
state,” and discussing how the West developed the con-
cept of sovereignty to serve the colonial project. Each of
these suggestions is spot on. Some absences reflect my
attempt to avoid spreading the analysis too thin, such as
my discussion of the role of unauthorized immigration.
However, my argument is certainly compatible with the
expanding literature on the migration state. In particular,
Adamson and Tsourapas’ work on its postcolonial variant
dovetails with my analysis of the performance of sover-
eignty in the Global South, and I regret not making
this connection explicitly. Engaging with Achiume’s
work on “migration as decolonization” and discrimina-
tion against refugees provides a possible way forward to
integrate these themes into an expanded analysis of how
state sovereignty allows color-blind racism to fester in
international migration.
Hamlin also raises questions about the language I use to

describe the baseline model. She notes that the analysis
“reveals that there is much less legal immigration than
there would be if push and pull factors acted unobstructed
by law,” and wonders whether the model estimates migra-
tion in a world with open borders. I frame the model as I
do for two reasons. First, the law’s obstructions are implic-
itly included in the model because variables like regime
type and conflict are correlated with migration policies.
Second, although my initial inclination was to explicitly
model an open borders world, I settled on a more conser-
vative strategy to guard against criticisms that the analysis
was too far-fetched or idealistic. One benefit of this choice
is that the results provide a best-case scenario estimate for
the amount of racial bias in global migration.
Hamlin’s final point concerns the possibility of change.

I show that Global North states continue to benefit from a
denial of colonialism’s effects, which makes systemic
change unlikely. Yet I speculate about whether certain
exogenous shocks like COVID-19 or climate change will
exacerbate or ameliorate racial bias. Living through the
pandemic made me less sanguine about the possibility of
the latter, and my recent work on the moral basis of public
attitudes toward unauthorized immigrants reflects this
pessimism (Rosenberg, “Agents, Structures, and theMoral
Basis of Deportability,” Security Dialogue,1-18 [2022]).
Indeed, one lesson of both Hamlin’s and my own book
concerns not only the persistence of systemic inequalities,
but also their intractability. Future work should dig fur-
ther into the overlapping international and domestic
mechanisms that entrench this system.
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