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tions in Acute Care Hospitals,'" and we appreciate the at­
tention of Kerry J. Edgar to this article.2 It appears that the 
greatest concern expressed in the letter reflects the fact that 
we restricted our comments in section 4, subsection III, point 
3 to positive-pressure needleless connectors with mechanical 
valves rather than addressing needleless connectors with me­
chanical valves in general. The letter reviews 4 studies that 
note an increased incidence of catheter-related infection with 
use of mechanical valves. These are the studies we referenced 
in the compendium.1 As noted in the letter, of these 4 recently 
published studies in the peer-reviewed literature about the 
association of mechanical valves with an increased incidence 
of catheter-related infections, 3 involved positive-pressure de­
vices. Thus, on the basis of the literature review performed 
while drafting the compendium, the recommendation as writ­
ten is accurate in that it represents a summary of the evidence 
available at that time. The letter refers to the abstract by 
Garcia and Jendresky3 that did not find a difference in the 
rate of central line-associated bloodstream infection with the 
use of positive-pressure connectors, compared with the use 
of split-septum connectors. However, we did not include an­
other abstract by Karchmer et al.4 that showed a significantly 
higher rate of central line-associated bloodstream infections 
with the use of mechanical valve connectors, some of which 
were positive-pressure connectors, because the methodology 
of the compendium included citations of peer-reviewed 
publications only. 

The letter notes that "The mechanical valves studied were 
not utilized according to the manufacturer's instructions for 
use," suggesting that a breach in aseptic technique when han­
dling the device, rather than the device itself, is associated 
with an increased risk of infection. This is a crucial point in 
the use of any medical device, and we addressed this issue 
by including the importance of education in section 4, sub­
section III, point 3: "Do not routinely use positive-pressure 
needleless connectors with mechanical valves before a thor­
ough assessment of risks, benefits, and education regarding 
proper use." Nevertheless, it is hoped that manufacturing of 
such devices in the future will involve fail-safe engineering 
advances aimed at further mitigation of the risk of infection 
in the complex hospital environment in which they are used. 
Both SHEA and the IDSA remain committed to keeping the 
compendium in alignment with current published evidence, 
and, together, the societies are undertaking a formal review 
and updating process. 
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Strategies to Prevent Catheter-Associated 
Urinary Tract Infection 

To the Editor—We commend the Society of Healthcare Ep­
idemiologists of America (SHEA) and the Infectious Disease 
Society of America (IDSA) for developing the recently pub­
lished Compendium of Strategies to Prevent Healthcare-As­
sociated Infections,' which offers practical approaches for de­
veloping comprehensive infection prevention programs. 
Unfortunately, the methodology used for literature search or 
data extraction is not mentioned. It appears that some rel­
evant articles were not reviewed, and that data from some 
reviewed articles were misinterpreted, particularly for the ar­
ticle by Lo et al.2 on strategies to prevent catheter-associated 
urinary tract infection. 

Lo et al.2 offer 3 references3"5 for their statement that "Re­
views and meta-analyses of silver-coated urinary catheters... 
consistently conclude [italics added] that evidence does not 
support a recommendation for the uniform use of such de­
vices. "2<pS43) In the first reference, however, Brosnahan et al.3 

conclude that silver alloy catheters "significantly" reduce the 
rates of both symptomatic and asymptomatic catheter-asso­
ciated urinary tract infection,3(pl) and that "results suggest that 
the use of silver alloy indwelling catheters for catheterizing 
hospitalized adults reduces the risk of catheter-acquired uri­
nary tract infection. "3(p2) Johnson et al.4 conclude that "ac­
cording to fair-quality evidence, antimicrobial urinary cath-
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eters can prevent bacteriuria in hospitalized patients during 
short-term catheterization..."4(pll6) Lastly, Niel-Weise et al.5 

do conclude that there are insufficient data to support the 
use of silver-coated catheters because of the paucity of well-
controlled studies.5 However, in another meta-analysis (not 
referenced in the compendium), Saint et al.6 conclude that 
"this meta-analysis clarifies discrepant results among trials of 
silver-coated urinary catheters by revealing that silver alloy 
catheters are significantly more effective in preventing urinary 
tract infections than are silver oxide catheters."6(p236> 

Lo et al.2 also state that "silver-alloy catheters may decrease 
bacteriuria but have not been shown to decrease symptomatic 
infection or other undesirable outcomes. "2<pS43) This statement 
contradicts the statement by Brosnahan et al.3 that "the risk 
of symptomatic urinary tract infection was also found to be 
reduced with the use of silver alloy catheters."3(pl) Other un­
referenced publications, such as those by Newton et al.7 and 
Karchmer et al.,8 offer similar conclusions. In addition, the 
value of reducing bacteriuria is described in section 1.42<PS42) 

of the article by Lo et al.,2 wherein references are provided 
to support statements that bacteriuria can serve as a reservoir 
for organisms that can be transmitted to other patients or 
lead to sepsis. 

Finally, section 42<PS43-46» of the article by Lo et al.2 lists many 
recommendations for implementing prevention and moni­
toring strategies. The great majority of these are people de­
pendent and resource intensive. Nursing staff constraints and 
fatigue can lessen the impact of people-dependent measures, 
especially over time and during off-hour shifts. The use of 
silver alloy-coated catheters offers a strategy that is indepen­
dent of infrastructure and bedside practices. Although cost-
effectiveness data are limited, the data that exist support the 
use of these catheters.910 

Device manufacturers share with clinicians a common goal 
dedicated to reducing the risk of healthcare-associated infec­
tion. We want to ensure that Foley catheters are used only 
when clinically indicated. For patients who need a Foley cath­
eter, we want to reduce the risk of infection. The decision to 
use an antimicrobial-coated catheter should be based on the 
best available evidence, and we believe that the evidence sup­
ports the use of silver alloy-coated Foley catheters in patients 
at risk of a catheter-associated urinary tract infection. 
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Reply to Ciavarella and Ritter 

To the Editor—Ciavarella and Ritter1 discuss 4 meta-analyses 
in their letter questioning the recommendation that addresses 
routine use of antimicrobial-coated indwelling urethral cath­
eters in the recently published compendium of strategies to 
prevent healthcare-associated infections.2 They acknowledge 
Niel-Weise et al.3 concluded that evidence does not support 
the use of antimicrobial catheters and that there are sub­
stantial problems with the quality of most reported studies. 
The Cochrane review of Brosnahan et al.,4 as Ciavarella and 
Ritter1 note, concluded that silver-alloy catheters are associ­
ated with a decrease in asymptomatic bacteriuria and symp­
tomatic infection, but it also concluded that "further eco­
nomic evaluation is required to confirm that the reduction 
of infection compensates for the increased cost." This Coch­
rane review was updated in 2008, subsequent to the publi­
cation of the compendium.5 The updated review again con­
cluded that catheters coated with silver alloy or antibiotics 
may decrease asymptomatic catheter-acquired bacteriuria but 
that study quality is generally poor and further economic 
analysis is needed. Symptomatic urinary infection was ad­
dressed in only one study in the update, with no benefit 
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