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would be analagous to attempting to claim that the
Huntington's disease gene does not cause dementia
because none of the relatives without HD show
dementia.

They next claim that the increased frequency of
these behaviours in the relatives that they observed
was not due to the Gts gene(s), but was instead due
to the presence of OCD. Again they seem to have
forgotten their own paper (Pauls & Leckman, 1986)
showing that the Gts gene(s) can cause OCD with
or without tics. Thus, they would accept that Gts
genes cause OCD, and that OCD produces depres
sion and anxiety disorders, but deny the whole
equation that Gts genes can cause depression and
anxiety disorders. The demonstration by Pauls et a!,
of the increased frequency of associated behaviours
in relatives with OCD but no tics, totally supports
our suggestion that some individuals in the general
population without tics may have these conditions
because they carry Gts genes.
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Sm: The study by Fear et a! (BJP, October 1994,
165, 506â€”509),their prior correspondence (BJP,
March 1993, 162, 421-423), and two previous
studies (Mitchell et a!, 1991; Malsch et a!, 1992)
resurrect the issue of whether ECT seizure duration
per se isrelatedto the antidepressiveefficacyof
ECT. For example, Malsch et a! (1992) state that
â€œ¿�oneof the unsolved questions of [ECT] is the effect
of seizure duration on the efficacy of treatmentâ€•.

The notion that ECT seizure duration might
be related to its antidepressive efficacy has been
advanced by the works of Maletzky (1978) and
Kramer (1983). However, neither investigation
demonstrated a significant positive correlation
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Tourette's syndrome and psychiatric disorders

Sm: Pauls et al(BJP, February 1994, 164,215-221)
claim to provide evidence against our proposal
(Comings & Comings, 1987; Comings, 1995a,b)
that depression and anxiety disorders are geneti
cally related to the TS (Gts) gene(s). In reality their
report provides strong evidence in favour of such a
relationship.

Pauls et a! have consistently maintained that the
wide range of psychiatric disorders comorbid to
Tourette's syndrome (TS) are all due to proband
ascertainment bias, and would not be increased in
frequency in the relatives of TS probands. Now
they find that in fact the frequency of generalised
anxiety disorder, major depressive disorder, panic
disorder, simple and social phobia are significantly
increased in frequency in 338 relatives of TS
probands compared with 113 relatives of controls
(Table 2). To extricate themselves from this turn of
events, they now retreat to the extraordinary posi
tion of claiming that these disorders are unrelated
to the Gts genes because their frequency is not
significantly higher in first degree relatives without
TS, chronic tics (CT) or obsessive-compulsive dis
order (OCD) compared with relatives of controls.
However, their own studies state that TS is inher
ited as an autosomal dominant trait with 100%
penetrance in males, and when OCD is included,
71% penetrance in females (Pauls & Leckman,
1986). Thus, only 15%of relatives of TS probands
without TS, CT or OCD should be carrying the Gts
genes. As such, one would not be able to identify
any of the pliotrophic effects of the Gts genes in a
group of subjects where so few carry the genes. This

DepartmentofMedicalGenetics
CityofHope MedicalCenter
Duarte,CA 91010
USA

ECT seizure duration and efficacy

https://doi.org/10.1192/bjp.166.3.399b Published online by Cambridge University Press

https://doi.org/10.1192/bjp.166.3.399b


400 CORRESPONDENCE

between the antidepressive efficacy and seizure
duration without confounding seizure duration
with the actual number of ECT treatments admin
istered. However, because existing studies compar
ing methohexitone (Malsch et a!, 1992; Fear et a!)
or thiopentone (Mitchell et a!, 1991) to propofol
anaesthesia have found no seizure duration effect
with the same number of treatments, one must
conclude that seizure duration is irrelevant to the
antidepressive efficacy. Furthermore, no other
well-controlled ECT study to date has demon
strated a relation between seizure duration and
antidepressive efficacy.

What appears to be important with respect to
therapeutic efficacy, as discussed elsewhere (BJP,
May 1983, 142, 536â€”537),is not the precise dura
tion of seizure activity, but rather the administra
tion of 5â€”12adequately generalised tonic-clonic
seizures of at least 20 seconds duration (American
Psychiatric Association, 1990). In this regard, two
points should be made. Firstly, in the two studies
comparing propofol with methohexitone anaes
thesia (Malsch et a!, 1992; Fear et at'), adequate
numbers of seizures were administered (approxi
mate mean number of treatments across studies: 7.7
(methohexitone) and 7.3 (propofol)) which were
of adequate duration (mean seconds of seizure
activity: 46.9 (methohexitone) and 37.1 (propofol)).

Secondly, electrically induced seizures may vary
in degree of generalisation (BJP, May 1983, 142,
536â€”537).More precisely, seizure generalisation
may increase in a curvilinear fashion (i.e. quadratic
curve) until an asymptote (â€œceilingeffectâ€•)is
reached with respect to the amount of electrical
energy delivered (Sackheim et a!, 1993). When this
asymptote is reached, the antidepressive efficacy of
ECT has probably reached its maximum; seizure
duration at this point is probably just a correlate of
the causal relationship between seizure generalis
ation and electrical energy, the latter of which
alleviates depression.
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Aumoa.s REPLY:We thank Dr Daniel for his
correspondence, which is broadly supportive of
the points made in our paper. It is encouraging to
see that the evidence concerning seizure duration
and the efficacy of ECT continues to be critically
appraised, since it is only through this that an
understanding of the mechanisms underlying
effective ECT will be ascertained. There are some
points raised in the letter which merit further
consideration.

There are significant problems in interpreting the
literature with respect to the relationship between
antidepressive efficacy and seizure duration. In ad
dition to the error of combining the effects of
seizure duration with those of treatment numbers
so as to obscure the true effect of each, it is difficult
to know how it would be possible to show, simply,
a positive correlation between antidepressive effi
cacy and seizure duration. Clearly it is far easier to
show statistically that two samples differ rather
than to prove that they do not. There is, however,
increasing evidence that seizure duration in current
ECT practice is not clinically relevant so long as a
seizure occurs. Perhaps useful progress could be
made in attempting to define what constitutes a
seizure, since existing literature is conflicting, and
this would represent an important step in the
standardisation of ECT research.

Daniel inadvertently illustrates this point in cal
culating mean seizure durations across two recent
studies (Malsch eta!, 1992; Fear eta!). These figures
are not directly comparable since they invoke
different methods of measuring seizure duration.
The first study used the purely motor manifes
tations of a seizure to measure its duration, using
the â€œ¿�cufftechniqueâ€•,whereas in the second, both
physical (unspecified method) and EEG durations
were measured. In a third paper (Mitchell et a!,
1991), physical measurement was performed â€œ¿�byan
experienced psychiatric nurse without use of the
â€˜¿�cull'(isolated arm) methodâ€•.Under these circum
stances, it is not valid to say that the seizures were
of adequate duration since the comparability of
their durations is uncertain.
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